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 This glossary contains certain defi nitions and other terms as they relate to the Company and the Group and as they are used 
in the Annual Report. These defi nitions may, or may not, correspond to standard industry defi nitions.

Fetion
Instant messaging business provided by the Group which 
enables customers to communicate instantly through various 
means such as SMS, integrating functions of chatting, 
socializing and interactive entertainment.

Handset Internet Access
A service provided by China Mobile to its customers enabling 
wireless access to the Internet (including WAP and WWW 
websites) using mobile handsets.

Internet of Th ings
Equipping SIM cards, sensors, two-dimensional codes etc to 
different objects and connecting them to a wireless network 
can capacitate intelligence to inanimate objects and enables 
forms of conversation and communication between people 
and things, and between things themselves. This network of 
interconnected objects is called the “the Internet of Things”. 
“Internet of Things” possesses three distinguishing features, 
namely: scalability, mobility and security.

LTE
Long Term Evolution, a mainstream standard for the 
evolution of 3G technology. It is wireless broadband data 
business oriented, and has the characteristics of high speed, 
less time delay and high quality. LTE has two models, namely 
FDD and TDD, of which TDD (also known as TD-LTE) is a 
standard for the evolution of TD-SCDMA technology. The 
two models of LTE can be developed in a coordinated 
manner to utilize symmetrical and asymmetrical bandwidths 
flexibly and efficiently. LTE can be integrated and co-exist 
with the existing 2G and 3G networks.

Mobile Internet 
Mobile Internet is an emerging market created by the cross 
convergence of Internet and mobile communications after 
their respective development. Mobile users could gain 
wireless access to the Internet anytime and anywhere by 
using wireless terminals such as mobile handsets and mobile 
Internet terminals to meet their needs. 

Mobile Market
Mobile Market is an integrated market assembling different 
kind of developers and their outstanding applications, 
enabling customers using different terminals to satisfy their 
demand for rea l t ime exper ience, downloads and 
subscription.

Mobile Paper
A business developed through cooperation between the 
Group and mainstream media which provides customers 
with updated information (including contents such as news, 
sports, entertainment, cultural activities and lifestyle) through 
MMS and WAP, etc.

Mobile Wallet
An integrated mobile payment service targeting mobile 
customers with China Mobile accounts using mobile 
terminals as payment tools. In accordance with different 
business natures, Mobile Wallet business could be classifi ed 
as remote payment (Mobile Wallet account) and on-site 
payment (Mobile Wallet), which provides customers with 
functions such as recharging, payment and enquiries 
through RFID, WWW, SMS/MMS and STK, etc.

OPhone
OPhone platform is a software platform for intelligent 
terminals for mobile Internet developed at the lead of China 
Mobile which owns its intellectual property right. OPhone is 
a mobile handset researched and developed based on this 
platform.

TD-SCDMA
Time Division-Synchronous Code Division Multiple Access, 
China’s home-grown 3G mobile technology standard, is one 
of the international mainstream 3G standards. The Group’s 
3G network adopts TD-SCDMA standard.

Wireless Music
A business which provides musical services to customers 
through mobile telecommunications networks. Currently it 
mainly consists of ‘‘Color Ring’’, ‘‘Ringtone Download’’ and 
‘‘IVR for Wireless Music’’.

139 Community
139 Community is an integrated community service on the 
Internet provided to China Mobile customers. By using the 
mobile number, community users enjoy access to a variety of 
services such as iTalk, social circles, games, G3 voice calling 
and music through their personal computers or mobile 
handsets to login to 139 Community anytime, satisfying 
customers’ needs for cross-platform sharing, communication, 
interaction and entertainment, etc.

139 Mailbox
A mailbox service introduced by the Group which possesses 
usual Internet based mailbox functions and at the same time 
fully util izes the advantages of handsets by enabling 
customers to send and receive as well as manage their emails 
through SMS, MMS and WAP.


